
  
 

 
  

 
 
 
 
Ref: FOI/00123/CMICB 
17 November 2022 
  
 
Your Request: 
 

1) Which organisation(s) currently deliver the CCGs Improving Access to 
Psychological Therapies (IAPT) Service?  
 
2) Which Patient Administration System/Clinical Recording System does 
the provider(s) use within service delivery?  
 
3) On what date does/do the ICBs current IAPT Service(s) expire?  
 
4) Is there an optional contract extension in place for this/these IAPT 
service(s)? If so, for how long?  
 
5) Does the ICB have current plans to go out to tender for a new IAPT 
service(s) and if so, when?  
 
6) What is the current annual value of the ICBs current IAPT Service(s)? 
  
7) Have any of the ICBs current IAPT providers been issued with a 
performance notice during the lifetime of the contact and/or the last 12-
months? If yes, what did the notice relate to?  
 
 

Our Response: 
 

Please find listed below the information held by each of the former CCG areas 
that now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the 
information requested regarding the commissioned Improving Access to 
Psychological Therapies (IAPT) Services. 

 
Cheshire  
1) Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust (CWP) and The Big 
Life Group. 
2) Information not held. 
3) 31 March 2023. 
4) No. 
5) No. 
6) Information not identifiable for cost of IAPT service commissioned from CWP 
as this service is commissioned as part of a wider block contract for a range of 
mental health services. IAPT services commissioned from The Big Life Group 
during 2021/22 had an annual value of £1,817,063. 
7) No. 

 
Halton 
1) Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust. 
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2) Rio. 
3) 31 March 2023. 
4) Currently on a rolling contract. 
5) No. 
6) £1,541,600. 
7) No. 

 
Knowsley 
1) Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust. 
2) Information not held. 
3) IAPT service sits within annual rolling NHS block contract for a range of 
healthcare services, with no separately defined end date. 
4) n/a. 
5) No. 
6) Information not identifiable for cost of IAPT service commissioned, as 
commissioned as part of a wider block contract for a range of mental health 
services with no separately defined cost. 
7) No. 
 
Liverpool  
1) Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust. 
2) Laptus. 
3) IAPT services sit within annual rolling NHS contracts, with no separately 
defined end date. 
4) n/a. 
5) No. 
6) £6,717,897. 
7) No. 

 
South Sefton/Southport & Formby 
1) Mental Health Matters. 
2) Information not held. 
3) 31 December 2024. 
4) 3-year optional extension. 
5) No. 
6) South Sefton: £1,620,589 / Southport & Formby: £1,193,316. 
7) No. 
  
St Helens  
1) Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust. 
2) Information not held. 
3) 31 October 2023. 
4) Extended on 01 November 2020 for three years. 
5) No. 
6) £2,525,000. 
7) No. 
 
Warrington 
1) Mental Health Matters. 
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2) IAPTUS. 
3) 31 March 2023. 
4) No. 
5) No. 
6) £2,918,268. 
7) No. 

 
Wirral  
1) Insight IAPT. 
2) Insight+. 
3) 31 March 2024. 
4) No. 
5) No. 
6) £5,629,782. 
7) No. 
 

Your Request: 
 
8) Which organisation(s) currently deliver the ICBs community 
musculoskeletal (MSK) Service or integrated MSK Service?  
 
9) Which Patient Administration System/Clinical Recording System does 
the provider(s) use within service delivery?  
 
10) On what date does the ICBs current community MSK 
Service(s)/integrated MSK Service(s) expire?  
 
11) Is there an optional contract extension in place for this community 
MSK service/integrated MSK Service? If so, for how long?  
12) Does the ICB have current plans to go out to tender for a new 
community MSK service/ integrated MSK Service and if so, when?  
 
13) What is the current annual value of the ICBs current community MSK 
Service/integrated MSK Service?  
 
14) Have any of the ICBs current community MSK providers/integrated 
MSK Service providers been issued with a performance notice during the 
lifetime of the contact and/or the last 12-months? If yes, what did the 
notice relate to?  
 

Our Response: 
 

Please find listed below the information held by each of the former CCG areas 
that now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the 
information requested regarding the commissioned community MSK 
providers/integrated MSK Service providers. 

 
Cheshire  
8) The former NHS Cheshire CCG area currently has three community MSK 
service models in operation.  
 



 
 
 
 
 

Page 4 of 8 

The Community MSK Service in the former CCG footprint of NHS Eastern 
Cheshire CCG is based on an AQP model with the providers on the framework 
listed below: 
 
- AIM Physiotherapy 
- Vernova CIC 
- East Cheshire NHS Trust 
- John Honey Physiotherapy 
- Physiofit 
- Premier Physical Healthcare 
- Spire Healthcare 
 
The Community MSK Service in the former CCG footprint of NHS South 
Cheshire CCG and NHS Vale Royal CCG is provided by Central Cheshire 
Integrated Care Partnership (CCICP). 
 
The Community MSK Service in the former CCG footprint of NHS West 
Cheshire CCG is provided by Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation 
Trust (CWP). 
 
9) Information not held. 
10) The Community MSK Service contracts in the former CCG footprint of NHS 
Eastern Cheshire CCG are due to end on 31 March 2023. The Community MSK 
Service contract in the former CCG footprint of NHS South Cheshire CCG and 
NHS Vale Royal CCG are due to end in September 2023. The Community 
Physiotherapy Service contract, which includes Community MSK Services, in 
the former CCG footprint of NHS West Cheshire CCG does not have an end 
date currently specified. 
11) No. 
12) No. 
 
13) The Community MSK Service in the former CCG footprint of NHS Eastern 
Cheshire CCG is based on an AQP model and does not have a specified 
annual contract value.  
 
The Community MSK Service in the former CCG footprint of NHS South 
Cheshire CCG and NHS Vale Royal CCG is provided as part of a block contract 
on a tariff-based service with no annual contract value.  
 
The Community MSK Service in the former CCG footprint of NHS West 
Cheshire CCG is provided as part of a block contract for a range of Community 
Physiotherapy Services. Due to nature of this block contract for Community 
Physiotherapy Services, there is no contract value specifically for the 
Community MSK element of this service. 
 
14) No. 

 
Halton 
8) Warrington & Halton Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust. 
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9) Lorenzo and EMIS web. 
10) 31 March 2023. 
11) Rolling contract. 
12) No. 
13) £945,362. 
14) No. 

 
Knowsley 
8) Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust. 
9) Information not held. 
10) Community MSK services sit within annual rolling NHS contracts, with no 
separately defined end date. 
11) n/a. 
12) No. 
13) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community MSK services 
14) No. 
 
Liverpool  
8) Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust. 
9) Information not held. 
10) Community MSK services sit within annual rolling NHS contracts, with no 
separately defined end date. 
11) n/a. 
12) No. 
13) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community MSK services 
14) No. 

 
South Sefton/Southport & Formby 
8) South Sefton: Liverpool University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust / 
Southport & Formby: Southport & Ormskirk Hospital NHS Trust. 
9) Information not held. 
10) Community MSK services sit within annual rolling acute contracts, with no 
separately defined end date. 
11) n/a. 
12) No. 
13) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community MSK services. 
14) No. 
  
St Helens  
8) Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust. 
9) Information not held. 
10) 31 March 2023. 
11) No. 
12) No. 
13) £1,830,506. 
14) No. 
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Warrington 
8) Bridgewater Community Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust. 
9) SystemOne. 
10) 31 March 2023. 
11) Rolling contract. 
12) No. 
13) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community MSK services 
14) No. 

 
Wirral  
8) Wirral University Teaching Hospital NHS Foundation Trust. 
9) Information not held. 
10) 30 June 2023. 
11) No. 
12) No. 
13) £24,452,933. 
14) Yes – contract performance notice issued in relation to waiting times. 
 

Your Request: 
 
15) Which organisation(s) currently deliver the ICBs community 
dermatology service?  
 
16) On what date does the ICBs current community dermatology service 
expire?  
 
17) Is there an optional contract extension in place for this community 
dermatology service? If so, for how long?  
 
18) Does the ICB have current plans to go out to tender for a new 
community dermatology service and if so, when?  
 
19) What is the current annual value of the CCGs current community 
dermatology service?  
 
20) Have any of the CCGs current community dermatology service 
providers been issued with a performance notice during the lifetime of the 
contact and/or the last 12-months? If yes, what did the notice relate to? 
 

Our Response: 
 

Please find listed below the information held by each of the former CCG areas 
that now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the 
information requested regarding the commissioned providers of community 
dermatology services. 

 
Cheshire  
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15) Central Cheshire Integrated Care Partnership / Cheshire & Wirral 
Partnership NHS Foundation Trust / Vernova CIC. 
16) Currently on an annual rolling contract. 
17) n/a. 
18) No. 
19) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community dermatology services. 
20) No. 

 
Halton 
15) GP Health Connect Ltd. 
16) 31 March 2023. 
17) Rolling contract. 
18) No. 
19) £125,000. 
20) No. 

 
Knowsley 
15 – 20) No local community dermatology services commissioned. 
 
Liverpool  
15) Liverpool University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust. 
16) Currently on an annual rolling NHS contract. 
17) n/a. 
18) No. 
19) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community dermatology services. 
20) No. 

 
South Sefton/Southport & Formby 
15) DMC Healthcare. 
16) Currently on an annual rolling contract. 
17) n/a. 
18) No. 
19) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community dermatology services. 
20) Yes, however, this related to the previous commissioned provider of 
community dermatology services, the contract for which was ceased during the 
2021/22 financial year. 
  
St Helens  
15) St Helens & Knowsley Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust. 
16) 31 March 2023. 
17) No. 
18) No. 
19) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community dermatology services. 
20) No. 
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Warrington 
15) Bridgewater Community Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust. 
16) 31 March 2023. 
17) Rolling Contract. 
18) No. 
19) Part of block payment for a range of healthcare services with no separately 
identified value specifically for community dermatology services. 
20) No. 

 
Wirral  
15) Bridgewater Community Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust. 
16) 31 March 2023. 
17) No. 
18) No. 
19) £450,000 spend in last 12 months. 
20) No. 

 
 


