
  
 

Ref: FOI/00068/CMICB 
15 September 2022 
  
Your Request: 
 

1) How many operating theatres are there in each of the hospitals in the 
trust as of August 2022?  
 

2) How many operating theatres equipped with a laminar flow system are 
there in each of the hospitals in the trust as of August 2022?  
 

3) How many operating theatres used for orthopaedic surgery are there in 
each of the hospitals in the trust as of August 2022? 
 

Our Response: 
 

1 - 3) Please find listed below the information held by each of the former CCG 
areas that now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to 
operating theatres at NHS Trusts within our geographical area. 

 

Cheshire 
Information not held. Please redirect to local NHS Trusts listed below along with 
their contact details for Freedom of Information Requests: 
 

- East Cheshire NHS Trust 
  ecn-tr.foirequests@nhs.net  
 

- Mid Cheshire Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 
  foi.foi@mcht.nhs.uk  
 

- Countess of Chester Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
  foi.enquiries@coch.nhs.uk  
 
Halton & Warrington  
Information not held. Please redirect to Warrington & Halton Teaching Hospitals 
NHS Foundation Trust, who can be contacted for Freedom of Information 
requests via: WHH.FOI@nhs.net. 

 

Knowsley & St Helens 
Information not held. Please redirect to St Helens and Knowsley Teaching 
Hospitals NHS Trust, who can be contacted for Freedom of Information 
requests via: foirequests@sthk.nhs.uk 
 

Liverpool  
Information not held. Please redirect to local NHS Trusts listed below along with 
their contact details for Freedom of Information Requests: 
 
- Alder Hey Children’s Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
  FOIRequests@alderhey.nhs.uk  
 
- Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Trust 
  FOIRequests@lhch.nhs.uk     
 
- Liverpool Women’s NHS Foundation Trust 
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  FOI@lwh.nhs.uk  
 
- Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 
  FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk  
 
- Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust 
  FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk  
 
- The Walton Centre NHS Foundation Trust 
  enquiries@thewaltoncentre.nhs.uk  
 

Sefton  
Information not held. Please redirect to Southport & Ormskirk NHS Trust, who 
can be contacted for Freedom of Information requests via: soh-tr.FoI@nhs.net 

 
Wirral  
Information not held. Please redirect to Wirral University Teaching Hospital NHS 
Foundation Trust, who can be contacted for Freedom of Information requests 
via: wih-tr.AccesstoInformationOffice@nhs.net  
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