Ref: FOI/00033/CMICB
02 September 2022

Your Request:

1) Do you have a Tier 3 Weight Management programme? If so, please
provide the contract expiry date, contract value and vendor name.

2) Who is the senior officer/officer (outside of procurement) responsible
for Tier 3 Weight Management?

3) Do you have a Diabetes Structured Education programme? If so, please
provide the contract expiry date, contract value and vendor name.

4) Who is the senior officer/officer (outside of procurement) responsible
for Diabetes Structured Education?

Our Response:

1 - 2) Please find listed below the data held by each of the former CCGs that
now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to Tier 3 Weight
Management Services:

Cheshire

Central Cheshire Integrated Care Partnership (CCICP) and Countess of
Chester NHS Foundation Trust (CoCH) are commissioned to deliver Tier 3
Weight Management Services. The contract with CCICP is due to expire on 30
September 2023 and has a contract value of £78,974. The contract with CoCH
is due to expire on 31 March 2023 and has a contract value of £59,977. There
is no specific person responsible for Tier 3 Weight Management Services.

Halton

Information not held. Please be advised that Tier 3 Weight Management
services are commissioned by Halton Borough Council Public Health. You may
wish to redirect your request for this information to Halton Borough Council who
can be contacted for Freedom of Information requests at hdl@halton.gov.uk.

Knowsley

Information not held. Please be advised that Tier 3 Weight Management
services are commissioned by Knowsley Council Public Health. You may wish
to redirect your request for this information to Knowsley Council who can be
contacted for Freedom of Information requests at foi@knowsley.gov.uk.

Liverpool

Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust are commissioned to
deliver Tier 3 Weight Management Services. The contract is a rolling NHS
Standard Contract which predates the former CCG since its inception in 2013
and had an annual value in 2021/22 of £706,037. The Senior Programme
Manager for Urgent Care is the lead person responsible for Tier 3 Weight
Management Services.


mailto:hdl@halton.gov.uk
mailto:foi@knowsley.gov.uk

Sefton

Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust are commissioned to
deliver Tier 3 Weight Management Services. This service is incorporated as
part of a wider rolling contract of services. Due to the nature of the this contract,
it is not possible to separately identify the specific value associated with the Tier
3 Weight Management Service element. The Deputy Director of Commissioning
and Redesign is the lead person responsible for Tier 3 Weight Management
Services.

St Helens

St Helens Wellbeing Service (City Health Care Partnership) are commissioned
by Public Health to deliver Tier 3 Weight Management Services. The contract
for this expires on 30 June 2024. Information not held regarding the contract
value or lead person responsible — you may wish to redirect your request for
this information to Public Health at St Helen’s Borough Council who can be
contacted for Freedom of Information requests via:
https://www.sthelens.gov.uk/article/6525/Raise-a-Freedom-of-Information-

request

Warrington

The Countess of Chester Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (CoCH) are
commissioned to deliver Tier 3 Weight Management Services. This service sits
within the overall acute contract with CoCH, with an approximate value of
£66,000. The current acute contract with CoCH expires on 31 March 2023 but is
expected to roll over into the following year. The Head of Healthcare
Commissioning is the lead person for Tier 3 Weight Management Services.

Wirral

Wirral Community Health & Care NHS Foundation Trust are commissioned to
deliver Tier 3 Weight Management Services as part of a wider block contract.
The block contract expires on 31 March 2023. Due to the nature of the block
contract, it is not possible to separately identify the specific value associated
with the Tier 3 Weight Management Service element. No specific person is
designated as being the lead person for Tier 3 Weight Management Services.

Your Request:

3) Do you have a Diabetes Structured Education programme? If so, please
provide the contract expiry date, contract value and vendor name.

4) Who is the senior officer/officer (outside of procurement) responsible
for Diabetes Structured Education?

Our Response:

3 - 4) Please find listed below the data held by each of the former CCGs that
now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to Diabetes
Structured Education programmes:
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Cheshire

The Diabetes Structured Education Programme for Cheshire is commissioned
from Vernova CIC, Central Cheshire Integrated Care Partnership (CCICP) and
Countess of Chester Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (CoCH). The contract with
Vernova CIC is due to expire on 31 March 2023 and has a contract value of
£21,889. The contract with CCICP is due to expire on 30 September 2023 and
the contract with CoCH is due to expire on 31 March 2023. Neither of the
contracts with CCICP or COCH have a separately identified spend specifically
for Diabetes Structured Education as this is part of a wider block contract for a
range of services.

Halton

Diabetes Structured Education Programme for Halton is commissioned from the
Countess of Cheshire Hospital NHS Foundation Trust. The current contract is
due to expire on 31 March 2024 and has a contract value of £78,960. The Head
of Acute Commissioning is the lead person for Diabetes Structured Education.

Knowsley

Diabetes Structured Education Programme for Knowsley is commissioned as
part of the Diabetes Community Service provided by Aintree University Hospital
via Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust. The current contract is
due to expire on 31/03/202. The contract does not have a separately identified
spend specifically for Diabetes Structured Education as this is part of a wider
block contract for a range of services.. The Head of Commissioning for Planned
Care is the lead person for Diabetes Structured Education.

Liverpool

Diabetes Structured Education (Type 1 and Type 2) is commissioned as part of
the Liverpool Diabetes Partnership (LDP) service at Liverpool University
Hospitals Foundation Trust (LUHFT). The contract is a core contract which has
been in place since the 2015/16 financial year with no end date specified. Total
investment in diabetes (including CQUIN) in 2019/20 was £4,333,470, of which
£2,492,420 is aligned to delivery of the LDP service specification. Additional
(non-recurrent) funding has also been provided to LUHFT in 20/21 to 23/24 via
the regional Diabetes Network (North West Coast Clinical Network), of which
£52,000 per annum is being provided (for Liverpool and Knowsley patients) to
further enhance delivery of Structured Education. The Programme Delivery
Manager for Cancer and Long-term Conditions is the lead person responsible
for Diabetes Structured Education (Type 1 and Type 2).

Sefton

The Diabetes Structured Education Programme for Sefton is commissioned
from Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust. The current contract is due to expire
on 31 March 2023 and has an approximate total value of £103,000. The Locality
Development Manager is the lead responsible for this.

St Helens
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The Diabetic Structured Education programme for St Helens is integrated within
the Tier 3 Diabetic treatment contract with St Helens & Knowsley Trust and as
such has no separately defined value. The contract expires on 31 March 2023
and the Commissioning & Transformation Manager/Senior Project Manager is
the lead responsible for this.

Warrington

The Diabetes Structured Education Programme for Warrington is commissioned
from Warrington & Halton Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (WHH). This service
sits within the overall acute contract with WHH, with an approximate value of
£66,000. The current acute contract with WHH expires on 31 March 2023 but is
expected to roll over into the following year. The Head of Healthcare
Commissioning is the lead person for Diabetes Structured Education.

Wirral

The Diabetes Structure Education Programme for Wirral is commissioned from
Wirral Community Health & Care NHS Foundation Trust as part of a wider block
contract. The block contract expires on 31 March 2023. Due to the nature of the
block contract, it is not possible to separately identify the specific value
associated with the Diabetes Structure Education Programme element. No
specific person is designated as being the lead person for Diabetes Structured
Education.
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