Ref: FOI/00190/CMICB
13 January 2023

Your Request:

We would appreciate it if you could let us know what fee your Integrated
Care Board pays doctors per assessment for:

1) Mental Health Act Assessments

2) Deprivation of Liberty safeguards Assessments
Our Response:

Please find listed below the information held in relation to the fees paid by the
former CCG areas that now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in
respect of Mental Health Act/Deprivation of Liberty safeguarding assessments:

Cheshire

1)£191.43

2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the local authorities. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to Cheshire East Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of
Information requests via: foi@cheshireeast.gov.uk and also Cheshire West &
Chester Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of Information requests
via: foi@cheshirewestandchester.gov.uk.

Halton

1) £173.37.

2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the Local Authority. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to Halton Borough Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of
Information requests via: hdl@halton.gov.uk.

Knowsley

1) £173.37

2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the Local Authority. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to Knowsley Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of
Information requests via: foi@knowsley.gov.uk

Liverpool

1) £173.37

2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the Local Authority. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to Liverpool City Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of
Information requests via: informationrequests@liverpool.gov.uk

Sefton
1) £174.56
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2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the Local Authority. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to Sefton Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of Information
requests via: ino.information@sefton.gov.uk

St Helens

1) £173.37.

2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the Local Authority. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to St Helens Borough Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of
Information requests via: www.sthelens.gov.uk/article/6525/Raise-a-Freedom-of-
Information-request

Warrington

1) £180.00.

2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the Local Authority. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to Warrington Borough Council, who can be contacted for Freedom
of Information requests via: foi@warrington.gov.uk.

Wirral

1)£192.18

2) Information not held. Deprivation of Liberty safeguard assessment fees are
paid by the Local Authority. You may wish to redirect your request for this
information to Wirral Council, who can be contacted for Freedom of Information
requests via:
wwa3.wirral.gov.uk/crmservicerequests/scripts/ServiceRequestMain.asp
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