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09 February 2023 
  
 
 
Your Request: 
 

1) Does your PCO offer a tier 3 weight management service (or equivalent 
specialist weight management service)? Is it self-commissioned? If 
commissioned elsewhere, where (other ICB/ health board/ trust)? 
 
2) For how many patients is your PCO’s tier 3 weight management service 
(or equivalent specialist weight management service) commissioned for? 

 
3 How many patients have been referred from your PCO to a tier 3 weight 
management service (or equivalent specialist weight management 
service) in the past 12 months? 

 
4) What is the average waiting time to access your Tier 3 weight 
management service (or equivalent specialist weight management 
service) in the past 12 months? 
 

Our Response: 
 

Please find listed below the information held regarding the Tier 3 Weight 
Management services commissioned in each of the former CCG areas that now 
make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB: 

 
Cheshire 
1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by the ICB from the 
below listed providers: 
 
- Countess of Chester Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (CoCH) 
- Central Cheshire Integrated Care Partnership (CCICP) 
2) The contract for the service commissioned from CoCH is not currently 
capped. The service commissioned from CCICP is monitored by the provider 
and contract stares that it should be reviewed if referral rate increases above 
10%. 
3 - 4) Information not held*. 
 
Halton 
1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by Halton Borough 
Council. 
2 - 4) Information not held*. 

 
Knowsley 
1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by Knowsley Council. 
2 - 4) Information not held*. 
 
Liverpool 
1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by Liverpool City 
Council. 
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2 - 4) Information not held*. 
 
Sefton 
1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by the ICB from 
Liverpool University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust. 
2 - 4) Information not held*. 
 
St Helens 
1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by St Helens Borough 
Council. 
2 - 4) Information not held*. 
 

    Warrington 
1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by the ICB from 
Countess of Chester Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (CoCH). 
2) The contract for the service commissioned from CoCH is for 35 patients per 
year. 
3 - 4) Information not held*. 
 
Wirral  
1) 1) Tier 3 Weight Management Services commissioned by the ICB from 
Wirral Community NHS Foundation Trust (WCFT). 
2) The contract for the service commissioned from WCFT is not currently 
capped and is commissioned in accordance with eligibility criteria. 
3 - 4) Information not held*. 
 

 
 
 
 
Your Request: 

 
5) Does your PCO have access to a tier 4 weight management service? If 
so, who Commissions it?  

 
6) How many patients have been referred to your PCO’s tier 4 weight 
management service (or equivalent specialist weight management 
service) in the past 12 months? 

 
7) What is the Current number of patients on a waiting list for Tier 4 
weight management services in your PCO 

 
8) What is the average waiting time to access your Tier 4 weight 
management service? 
 

Our Response: 
 

Please find listed below the information held regarding the Tier 4 Weight 
Management services commissioned in each of the former CCG areas that now 
make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB: 
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Cheshire 
5) Tier 4 Weight Management services commissioned by the ICB from 
University Hospitals of North Midlands NHS Trust (UHNM) 
6) The contract for the service commissioned from UHNM is not currently 
capped. 
7 - 8) Information not held*. 
 
Halton 
5) Tier 4 Weight Management services accessed as part of a collaborative 
contract led by NHS Lancashire & South Cumbria ICB. 
6 - 8) Information not held*. 

 
Knowsley 
1) Tier 4 Weight Management Services commissioned by Knowsley Council. 
6 - 8) Information not held*. 
 
Liverpool 
5) Tier 4 Weight Management Services commissioned by the ICB from the 
below listed providers: 
- Calderdale and Huddersfield NHS Foundation Trust 
- Phoenix Health 
6 - 8) Information not held*. 
 
Sefton 
5) Tier 4 Weight Management services accessed as part of a collaborative 
contract led by NHS Lancashire & South Cumbria ICB. 
6 - 8) Information not held*. 
 
 
St Helens 
5) Tier 4 Weight Management services commissioned by the ICB from Phoenix 
Health  
6 - 8) Information not held*. 
 

    Warrington 
5) Tier 4 Weight Management services accessed as part of a collaborative 
contract led by NHS Lancashire & South Cumbria ICB. 
6 - 8) Information not held*. 
 
Wirral  
5) Tier 4 Weight Management services commissioned by the ICB from 
University Hospitals of North Midlands NHS Trust (UHNM) 
6 - 8) Information not held*. 

 
Your Request: 
 

9) How many patients were referred through the 'local enhanced service 
for referrals' to weight management services in your PCO? 
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Our Response: 
 

Cheshire 
9) Information not held* 
 
Halton 
9) During the 2022/23 financial year (to date), 790 patients have been referred 
to weight management services. 

 
Knowsley 
9) Information not held* 
 
Liverpool 
9) Information not held* 
 
Sefton 
9) During the 2022/23 financial year (to date), 1,460 patients have been referred 
to weight management services. 
 
St Helens 
9) Information not held* 
 

    Warrington 
9) During the 2022/23 financial year (to date), 961 patients have been referred 
to weight management services. 

 
Wirral  
9) Information not held* 
 
 
*You may wish to redirect your request for this information to the commissioned 
providers of the Tier 3/4 Weight Management services in each of the former 
CCG areas that now makes up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB, which are 
listed below along with their contact details:  
 
Cheshire 
Tier 3 Weight Management Services: 

 
- Countess of Chester Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (CoCH) 
  foi.enquiries@coch.nhs.uk  
 
- Central Cheshire Integrated Care Partnership (CCICP) 
  foi.foi@mcht.nhs.uk  
 
Tier 4 Weight Management Services: 
 
- University Hospitals of North Midlands NHS Trust (UHNM) 
  FOI@uhnm.nhs.uk  

mailto:foi.enquiries@coch.nhs.uk
mailto:foi.foi@mcht.nhs.uk
mailto:FOI@uhnm.nhs.uk
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Halton 
Tier 3 Weight Management Services:  
 
- Halton Borough Council. 
  hdl@halton.gov.uk  
 
Tier 4 Weight Management Services: 
 
- NHS Lancashire & South Cumbria ICB 
  mlcsu.foiteam@nhs.net  
 
Knowsley 
Tier 3 and 4 Weight Management Services:  
 
- Knowsley Council. 
  foi@knowsley.gov.uk  
 
Liverpool 
Tier 3 Weight Management Services:  
 
- Liverpool City Council 
  informationrequests@liverpool.gov.uk  
 
Tier 4 Weight Management Services: 
 
- Calderdale and Huddersfield NHS Foundation Trust  
  foi@cht.nhs.uk     
 
- Phoenix Health 
  enquiries@phoenix-health.co.uk  
 
Sefton 
Tier 3 Weight Management Services: 
 
- Liverpool University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust      
  FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk   
  
Tier 4 Weight Management Services: 
 
- NHS Lancashire & South Cumbria ICB 
  mlcsu.foiteam@nhs.net  
 
St Helens 
Tier 3 Weight Management Services:  
 
- St Helens Borough Council 
  www.sthelens.gov.uk/article/6525/Raise-a-Freedom-of-Information-request 
 

mailto:hdl@halton.gov.uk
mailto:mlcsu.foiteam@nhs.net
mailto:foi@knowsley.gov.uk
mailto:informationrequests@liverpool.gov.uk
mailto:foi@cht.nhs.uk
mailto:enquiries@phoenix-health.co.uk
mailto:FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk
mailto:mlcsu.foiteam@nhs.net
http://www.sthelens.gov.uk/article/6525/Raise-a-Freedom-of-Information-request
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Tier 4 Weight Management Services: 
 
- Phoenix Health 
  enquiries@phoenix-health.co.uk  

 
    Warrington 

Tier 3 Weight Management Services: 
 
- Countess of Chester Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (CoCH) 
  foi.enquiries@coch.nhs.uk  
 
Tier 4 Weight Management Services: 
 
- NHS Lancashire & South Cumbria ICB 
  mlcsu.foiteam@nhs.net  
 
Wirral 
Tier 3 Weight Management Services: 

 
- Wirral Community NHS Foundation Trust (WCFT). 
  wcnt.foi@nhs.net  
 
Tier 4 Weight Management Services: 
 
- University Hospitals of North Midlands NHS Trust (UHNM) 
  FOI@uhnm.nhs.uk  

 

mailto:enquiries@phoenix-health.co.uk
mailto:foi.enquiries@coch.nhs.uk
mailto:mlcsu.foiteam@nhs.net
mailto:wcnt.foi@nhs.net
mailto:FOI@uhnm.nhs.uk

