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Your Request: 
 

1) The current number of 5-11 year old school children in Cheshire West 
 

Our Response: 
 

1) NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB does not hold information specifically 
detailing the current number of 5 to 11 year old school children in the West 
Cheshire geographical area.  
 
You may wish to redirect your request for this information to Cheshire West and 
Chester Council, as the organisation responsible for school education and who 
can be contacted via the following email address: 
foi@cheshirewestandchester.gov.uk  
 

Your Request: 
 
2) The total number of CAMHS/CYMHS referrals for 5-11 year olds in 
Cheshire West over the past year (January to December 2022) 
 
3) The current average waiting time for CYPMHS referrals in Cheshire 
West 
 

Our Response: 
 

2 – 3) NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB does not hold information on the total 
number of CAMHS/CYPMH referrals for 5 to 11 year old children in the West 
Cheshire geographical area, or the current average waiting time for CWPMH 
referrals. 
You may wish to redirect your request for this information to Cheshire & Wirral 
Partnership NHS Foundation Trust as the commissioned provider of 
CAMHS/CYPMH services for Cheshire, who can be contacted via the following 
email address: cwp.foi@nhs.net 
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